
Subject: RE: Bills
From: Robert Buente </o=ExchangeLabs/ou=Exchange Administrative Group
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/cn=Recipients/cn=c7b1814176124b59b21d8fda30e507d8-
bbuente>
Date: 03/02/2018 08:22 AM
To: 'Ellen Riotto' <ellen@southpark.la>, Marcus Lieber
<Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>

I approved invoices this morning.

Robert Buente

President/CEO

1010 Development Corporation

1001 South Hope Street

Los Angeles, CA  90015

213-749-0214 x202

bbuente@1010dev.org

From: Ellen Riotto [mailto:ellen@southpark.la] 
Sent: Friday, March 2, 2018 8:07 AM
To: Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>
Cc: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>
Subject: Re: Bills

Hi Marcus  

Following up on this. Any chance you can upload today?

Thanks

Ellen Riotto

Executive Director 

South Park BID

1100 S Flower St, #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015 <x-apple-data-detectors://0/1> 

o. 213-663-1112 <tel:213-663-1112> 
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c. 401-439-8147 <tel:401-439-8147> 

24/7 <x-apple-data-detectors://1> : 866-560-9346 <tel:866-560-9346> 

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 27, 2018, at 1:50 PM, Ellen Riotto <ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la>
> wrote:

Hi Marcus,

FYI Bills have been uploaded to bill.com <http://bill.com> , including the Blue 
Shield auto-pay. 

Thanks,

Ellen

Ellen Riotto 

Executive Director
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